
Counseling Services 
 
Student Affairs 
Administrative Unit Assessment 
FY 18 (July 2017-July 2018) 
 
Department and Assessment Report Information 
Prepared on:7/23/2018 12:19:25 PM  By:predita.howard@mga.edu 

 



Objectives 
Each year, every department should identify objectives the department hopes to accomplish in the next year. 



Objective 2 

Objective 2: What was this department's second 
objective for this fiscal year? Objectives should be 
specific, measurable, and achievable within one 
year. 

Counseling Services will evaluate the effectiveness 
of the online appointment scheduling program in 
providing students more effective and timely 
access to services. 

Objective 2: How did your department measure this 
objective? (Survey, budget number, number of 
participants, jobs completed, measurable time 
and/or effort) 

At intake students were asked and their answers 
documented. 

Objective 2: What was your target outcome for this 
objective? (1.e. 80% participation, 5% enrollment 
growth, 7% change in engagement) 

50% of students will indicate use of online 
appointment scheduling program was effective 
and timely access to services. 

Objective 2: At what level did the department/area 
achieve on this objective? (This should be a number, 
i.e. 82%, 6%, 345 attendees, 75% engagement) 

85% agreed the system was beneficial. 

Objective 2: Did your department meet this 
objective? 

The department exceeded this objective. 

Objective 2: What did your department learn from 
working toward this objective? What changes will 
you make based on this effort next year? 

Students felt they could easily access our services 
through online scheduling. 

 
  



Objective 3 

Objective 3: What was this department's third 
objective for this fiscal year? Objectives should be 
specific, measurable, and achievable within one 
year. 

Students who receive counseling services will 
indicate whether or not they feel counseling was 
beneficial in resolving their presenting problem. 

Objective 3: How did your department measure this 
objective? (Survey, budget number, number of 
participants, jobs completed, measurable time 
and/or effort) 

Survey at the end of third session 

Objective 3: What was your target outcome for this 
objective? (1.e. 80% participation, 5% enrollment 
growth, 7% change in engagement) 

80% of students will indicate Counseling Services was 
beneficial in resolving their presenting problem. 

Objective 3: At what level did the department/area 
achieve on this objective? (This should be a 
number, i.e. 82%, 6%, 345 attendees, 75% 
engagement) 

40% of responding students indicated services were 
beneficial after 3 sessions. 

Objective 3: Did your department meet this 
objective? 

The department did not meet this objective. 

Objective 3: What did your department learn from 
working toward this objective? What changes will 
you make based on this effort next year? 

Need a more uniform systems to collect data. Will 
develop a survey to capture and track information 
from students utilizing services. 

 
  



Objective 4 

Objective 4: What was this department's fourth 
objective for this fiscal year? Objectives should be 
specific, measurable, and achievable within one 
year. 

N/A 

Objective 4: How did your department measure this 
objective? (Survey, budget number, number of 
participants, jobs completed, measurable time 
and/or effort) 

N/A 

Objective 4: What was your target outcome for this 
objective? (1.e. 80% participation, 5% enrollment 
growth, 7% change in engagement) 

N/A 

Objective 4: At what level did the department/area 
achieve on this objective? (This should be a number, 
i.e. 82%, 6%, 345 attendees, 75% engagement) 

N/A 

Objective 4: Did your department meet this 
objective? 

The department did not meet this objective. 

Objective 4: What did your department learn from 
working toward this objective? What changes will 
you make based on this effort next year? 

N/A 

 
  



Future Plans 

Please identify at least four measurable objectives 
for the next fiscal year. In listing the objectives, 
please use the 
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